
 
Tomato – Super Marmande 
 
Semi-bush (needs some staking) 
 
Classic beefsteak tomato, large, firm-
fleshed, meaty and full flavoured. The juicy, 
ribbed fruit produce few seeds making it an 
ideal tomato for salads, sandwiches and 
cooking. 
 
 
 
 
 
Tomato – Ailsa Craig 
 
Cordon – requires some support 
 
Prolific vines of fruit and reliability in any UK 
summer be it dry and sunny or damp and 
dull. Suitable for indoor and outdoor growing 
Delicious salad tomato 
 
 
. 
 
 
 
Tomato – Golden Sunrise 
 
Cordon – requires some support 
 
A versatile mid-sized early variety which 
produces good yields of golden-yellow, 
medium-sized, uniform fruit. Cultivated 
outdoors or under glass. Distinctive sweet 
taste. 
 
 
  



Tomato – Ildi 
 
Cordon – requires some support 
 
Mini, sweet, yellow, pear-shaped fruits hang 
like bunches of grapes, with up to an 
incredible 80 fruits per truss. Traditionally 
renowned in Italy as one of the best cooking 
tomatoes. 
 
Stays compact, fruit has good standing 
qualities and will keep you in fruit all 
summer.  
 
 
 
Tomato – Gardener’s Delight 
 
An outdoor variety with a compact habit ideal 
for hanging baskets and patio pots. 
 
A popular tomato with a simply outstanding 
flavour which produces masses of cherry 
tomatoes are produced on long trusses, and 
you don't even need a greenhouse! 
 
 
 
Tomato – Maskotka 
 
A dwarf bush variety that has been specially 
bred for growing in baskets and containers. 
 
Cascading stems that fall gently over the 
sides of their pots. produces a heavy crop of 
bite sized cherry tomatoes with a delicious, 
sweet flavour.  
 
.  



Courgette – Lemona 
 
Producing high yields of bright yellow 
courgettes ‘Lemona’ is a fantastic performer.  
 
The cylindrical fruits reach about 20cm in 
length and are wonderfully flavoured.  
 
 
 
 
 
Cucumber – Marketmore 
 
Reliable cucumber, producing large yields of 
8” (20cm) long, dark skinned fruits from July 
– October (when harvested regularly). 
 
Plants show some resistance to powdery 
and downy mildew. Do not remove male 
flowers. 
 
Best grown outdoors to trail on the soil. 
 
 
 
 
 
  



Chilli Pepper – Anaheim 
 
Mild and sweet provides just that little bit of 
heat. Perfect for serving as a fresh garnish 
to spicy dishes or salads adding a chilli 
pepper flavour.  
 
Produces a good crop of long green chilis 
over the course of the summer which can be 
picked and used when needed. Can also be 
left to ripen to a red-green colour.  
 
Long cropping season when grown in a 
greenhouse, can also be grown in a sunny 
spot on the patio.  
 
Chile Pepper – Padron 
 
This Spanish Tapas Pepper are variable in 
heat but ideally picked small and green for 
the lowest levels of heat. As the chillies get 
larger and mature to red, the heat increases.  
 
Excellent added to stir fries, stuffed or 
grilled. 
 
 
Sweet Pepper – Red King 
 
Sweet-flavoured red peppers of Sweet 
Pepper 'Red King' are generous in terms of 
fruit size, yield and flavour!  
 
The perfect pepper for stuffing and roasting, 
as well as for slicing and dipping or adding to 
salads.  
 
Crops throughout summer on strong, bushy 
plants, the peppers ripening from green to 
red throughout the season.  



Sweetcorn – Alliance 
Sturdy plants with outstanding disease 
resistance and hardy to seasonal 
temperature fluctuations.  
 
Super sweet variety perfect for growing at 
home with full 20cm (8in) cobs full of juicy 
kernels.  
 
Plants in grid formation around 40cm (16in) 
apart from each way will help your plants 
pollinate better. Harvest August - 
September, when the silks on the cob turn 
brown. 
 
 
 
Dwarf French Bean – Boston 
Sturdy, upright plants produce heavy crops 
over a long picking season.  
 
Straight, round 15cm (6in) long pods with a 
dark green colour and an excellent flavour.  
 
Plants around 15cm (6in) apart. Ideal for 
growing in containers. Height: 45cm (18"). 
Spread: 30cm (12"). 
 
 


